

**Gallup-McKinley County Schools**  
**PROCUREMENT -- TABULATION SHEET(S)**  
 BID NO. ITB-329-18WF      BID ON: Bus Parts Repair

Open Date: October 24, 2017 at 2:00 P.M. (Local)

Item No.	Items and Descriptions	Quantity	Summit Truck Group	Albuquerque Freightliner	US Distributing, Inc.	Dartco Transmission Sales & Service Inc.	Tarro Inc.	Rico Auto Complex	Gurley Motor Co.	
<b>Section A: Mechanical Repair &amp; Maintenance</b>										
1	Hourly Labor Rate for all preapirs performed by ASE Factory Trained/Certified Mechanics	Hour	133.00	130.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	70.00	No Bid	
2	Maintenance, Hourly Labor Rate	Hour	115.00	130.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	70.00	No Bid	
3	Parts for Maintenance & Repairs will be provided at _____ % OFF	%	10%	15%	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	40%	No Bid	
<b>Section B: Body Repairs</b>										
4	Hourly Labor Rate	Hour	75.00	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	50.00	48.00	No Bid	
5	Parts for Body Repairs will be provided at % OFF	%	10%	15%	No Bid	No Bid	Per Quote/Job	40%	No Bid	
<b>Section C: Transmission Rebuild and Repairs</b>										
6	Hourly Labor Rate for all preapirs performed by ASE Factory Trained/Certified Mechanics	Hour	113.00	N/A	No Bid	105.00	No Bid	70.00	No Bid	
7	Transmission Oil per quart for Rebuilds and Repairs	Quart	11.97	N/A	No Bid	6.88-10.49	No Bid	3.81	No Bid	
8	Parts for Mainteance and Repairs will provided at _____ % OFF	%	10%	15%	No Bid	28%	No Bid	40%	No Bid	
	Transmission and Differential Fluid Changes, filters, pan gaskets and band adjustments									
9	Automatic Transmission	Each	685.00	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	194.95-302.09	No Bid	

**Gallup-McKinley County Schools**  
**PROCUREMENT -- TABULATION SHEET(S)**  
 BID NO. ITB-329-18WF      BID ON: Bus Parts Repair

Open Date: October 24, 2017 at 2:00 P.M. (Local)

Item No.	Items and Descriptions	Quantity	Summit Truck Group	Albuquerque Freightliner	US Distributing, Inc.	Dartco Transmission Sales & Service Inc.	Tarro Inc.	Rico Auto Complex	Gurley Motor Co.	
10	Standard Transmission	Each	510.00	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	190.00	No Bid	
11	Front Differential	Each	308.20	130.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	215.50	No Bid	
12	Rear Differential	Each	249.80	130.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	215.50	No Bid	
13	4 x 4 Transfer Case	Each	350.00	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	120.00	No Bid	
<b>Section E: Towing Service</b>										
14	Hook Up Charge		N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	No Bid	
	Mileage Rate per mile									
15	In-Town		N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	No Bid	
16	Out-of-Town		N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	N/A	No Bid	
<b>Section F: Miscellaneous Services/Fees</b>										
17	Tear Down Charge		N/A	130.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	70.00	No Bid	
18	Miscellaneous Fees (Disposal of Hazardous Materials or Environmental Materials)		14.50	10% of Labor up to \$250 max	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	8% of Labor	No Bid	
<b>Section G: Purchase of Parts and Supplies ONLY</b>										

**Gallup-McKinley County Schools**  
**PROCUREMENT -- TABULATION SHEET(S)**  
 BID NO. ITB-329-18WF      BID ON: Bus Parts Repair

Open Date: October 24, 2017 at 2:00 P.M. (Local)

Page 3 of 3

Item No.	Items and Descriptions	Quantity	Summit Truck Group	Albuquerque Freightliner	US Distributing, Inc.	Dartco Transmission Sales & Service Inc.	Tarro Inc.	Rico Auto Complex	Gurley Motor Co.	
19	Parts for Maintenance and Repairs will be provided at ___ OFF List Price		10%	15%	35-50%	28%	No Bid	40%	35%	
20	Lamps and Bulbs		10%	15%	35-40%		No Bid	40%	30%	
21	Batteries, 5 Year Warranty		10%	15%	35-53%		No Bid	40%	20%	
22	Filters (air, oil, and fuel)		10%	15%	35-51%		No Bid	40%	35%	
23	Suspension & Steering (shocks, arms, gears)		10%	15%	35-53%		No Bid	40%	30%	
24	Brake Systems (pads, rotors, and shoes)		10%	15%	35-53%		No Bid	40%	35%	
25	New Starters and Alternators		10%	15%	35-56%		No Bid	40%	35%	
26	Belts, (V-type and Serpentine)		10%	15%	35-45%		No Bid	40%	35%	
27	Cooling System		10%	15%	35-53%		No Bid	40%	35%	
28	Differential		10%	15%	35-44%		No Bid	40%	35%	
29	Drive Train		10%	15%	35-44%		No Bid	40%	35%	
30	Tools		10%	15%	No Bid		No Bid	40%	No Bid	
	New Mexico Resident Business or Resident Veteran Preference			NM Resident Business	NM Resident Business			NM Resident Business		