



**Gallup-McKinley County Schools**  
**PROCUREMENT -- TABULATION SHEET(S)**  
 BID NO. ITB-327-18WF      BID ON: Art Supplies Materials

Open Date: October 24, 2017 at 2:00 P.M. (Local)

Item No.	Items and Descriptions	Quantity	Pyramid School Products	School Specialty, Inc.	S&S Worldwide	NASCO	Standard Stationery Supply Co.	Quill Corporation	Discount School Supply	Butler's Office Equipment & Supply
	Red	370 Package	2.39 884.30	1.76 651.20	1.98 732.60	2.48 917.60	1.92 710.40	2.05 758.50	2.35 869.50	2.66 984.20
	Violet	180 Package	1.89 340.20	1.61 289.80	1.83 329.40	2.15 387.00	1.79 322.20	1.03 185.40	2.35 423.00	2.13 383.40
	Lilac	100 Package	1.89 189.00	1.52 152.00	1.73 173.00	2.15 215.00	1.75 175.00	5.19 519.00	No Bid	2.13 213.00
	Yellow	300 Package	1.89 567.00	1.63 489.00	1.83 3.46	2.15 645.00	1.79 537.00	2.05 615.00	2.35 705.00	2.13 639.00
	Holiday Green	250 Package	1.89 472.50	1.61 402.50	1.83 457.50	2.15 537.50	1.79 447.50	2.05 512.50	2.35 587.50	2.13 532.50
	Light Green	100 Package	1.89 189.00	1.61 161.00	1.83 183.00	2.15 215.00	1.79 179.00	3.48 348.00	No Bid	2.13 213.00
	Brown	200 Package	1.99 398.00	1.52 304.00	1.89 378.00	2.15 430.00	1.84 368.00	2.05 410.00	No Bid	2.33 466.00
	Orange	240 Package	2.09 501.60	1.73 415.20	1.87 448.80	2.15 516.00	1.82 436.80	2.05 492.00	2.35 564.00	2.44 585.60
	White	580 Package	2.09 1,212.20	2.02 1,171.60	2.04 1,183.20	2.15 1,247.00	1.96 1,136.80	2.05 1,189.00	2.35 1,363.00	2.51 1,455.80
	Black	260 Package	1.99 517.40	1.73 449.80	2.02 525.20	2.15 559.00	1.94 504.40	2.05 533.00	2.35 611.00	2.28 592.80
	Gray	120 Package	1.89 226.80	1.52 182.40	1.80 216.00	2.15 258.00	1.76 211.20	5.19 622.80	No Bid	2.13 255.60
	Blue	220 Package	1.89 415.80	1.52 334.40	1.80 396.00	2.15 473.00	1.77 389.40	2.05 451.00	2.35 517.00	2.13 468.60
	Light Blue	120 Package	1.89 226.80	1.52 182.40	1.80 216.00	2.15 258.00	1.75 210.00	2.05 246.00	2.35 282.00	2.13 255.60

**Gallup-McKinley County Schools**  
**PROCUREMENT -- TABULATION SHEET(S)**  
 BID NO. ITB-327-18WF      BID ON: Art Supplies Materials

Open Date: October 24, 2017 at 2:00 P.M. (Local)

Item No.	Items and Descriptions	Quantity	Pyramid School Products	School Specialty, Inc.	S&S Worldwide	NASCO	Standard Stationery Supply Co.	Quill Corporation	Discount School Supply	Butler's Office Equipment & Supply
	Assorted, 10 colors	360 Package	2.39 860.40	2.03 730.80	2.38 856.80	2.48 892.80	2.27 817.20	2.05 738.00	No Bid	2.84 1,022.40
	Pink	200 Package	1.89 378.00	1.52 304.00	1.84 368.00	2.15 430.00	1.80 360.00	2.05 410.00	2.35 470.00	2.13 426.00
	<b>TOTAL ITEM NO. 2</b>		<b>\$ 7,379.00</b>	<b>\$ 6,220.10</b>	<b>\$ 6,466.96</b>	<b>\$ 7,980.90</b>	<b>\$ 6,804.90</b>	<b>\$ 8,030.20</b>	<b>\$ 6,392.00</b>	<b>\$ 8,493.50</b>
3	Fingerpaint Paper, 16" x 22", 100/Pkg, Pacon #5316 NO SUBSTITUTES	50 Package	2.95 147.50	No Bid	4.13 206.50	No Bid	2.85 142.50	7.59 379.50	4.82 241.00	4.67 233.50
4	Tagboard, Manila 12" x 18", 150 Lb., 100/Pkg. Pacon #5114 NO SUBSTITUTES	85 Package	6.95 590.75	4.96 421.60	7.36 625.60	No Bid	4.43 376.55	No Bid	No Bid	8.71 740.35
5	Tagboard, Manila 24" x 36", 150 Lb., 100/Pkg. Pacon #5126 NO SUBSTITUTES	30 Package	24.95 748.50	3.18 95.40	No Bid	No Bid	17.92 537.60	No Bid	No Bid	34.74 1,042.20
	<b>TOTAL ALL OR NONE ITEMS 4 &amp; 5</b>		<b>\$ 1,339.25</b>	<b>\$ 517.00</b>	<b>\$ 625.60</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$ 914.15</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$ 1,782.55</b>
6	Drawing Paper, 60#, 12" x 18" White, 500/Ream, Pacon #4712 NO SUBSTITUTES	120 Ream	14.95 1,794.00	No Bid	13.64 1,636.80	No Bid	10.10 1,212.00	No Bid	No Bid	22.33 2,679.60
7	Drawing Paper, 40#, 12" x 18", Cream, 500/Ream, Pacon #4012 NO SUBSTITUTES	50 Ream	10.95 547.50	No Bid	8.15 89.24	No Bid	7.31 365.50	No Bid	No Bid	9.76 488.00
	<b>TOTAL ALL OR NONE ITEM 6 &amp; 7</b>		<b>\$ 2,341.50</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$ 1,726.04</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$ 1,577.50</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$ 3,167.60</b>

**Gallup-McKinley County Schools**  
**PROCUREMENT -- TABULATION SHEET(S)**  
 BID NO. ITB-327-18WF      BID ON: Art Supplies Materials

Open Date: October 24, 2017 at 2:00 P.M. (Local)

Item No.	Items and Descriptions	Quantity	Pyramid School Products	School Specialty, Inc.	S&S Worldwide	NASCO	Standard Stationery Supply Co.	Quill Corporation	Discount School Supply	Butler's Office Equipment & Supply
8	Art Tissue Paper, 20" x 30", Assorted, 20/pkg, Pacon #58506 NO SUBSTITUTES	130 Package	1.95 253.50	1.71 222.30	2.30 299.00	2.00 260.00	1.71 222.30	3.03 393.90	No Bid	2.01 261.30
9	Art Tissue Paper, 12" x 18", Assorted, 50/pkg., Pacon #58520 NO SUBSTITUTES	170 Package	2.19 372.30	1.92 326.40	2.48 421.60	2.40 408.00	1.95 331.50	3.99 678.30	No Bid	2.27 385.90
<b>TOTAL ALL OR NONE ITEM 8 &amp; 9</b>			<b>\$ 625.80</b>	<b>\$ 548.70</b>	<b>\$ 720.60</b>	<b>\$ 668.00</b>	<b>\$ 553.80</b>	<b>\$ 1,072.20</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$ 647.20</b>
10	Watercolors, Oval 1/2 Pan with Brush, Prang #08000 NO SUBSTITUTES	480 Each	1.79 859.20	2.18 1,046.40	No Bid	2.35 1,128.00	1.53 734.40	3.19 1,531.20	No Bid	2.72 1,305.60
11	Crayons, 8 Count, Regular Size, Assorted Colors, Crayola #520008 NO SUBSTITUTES	550 Box	0.42 231.00	0.53 291.50	No Bid	0.57 313.50	0.42 231.00	0.49 269.50	0.71 390.50	0.55 302.50
12	Crayons, 24 Count, Regular Size, Assorted Colors, Crayola #523024 NO SUBSTITUTES	1,600 Box	1.18 1,888.00	1.31 2,096.00	No Bid	1.40 2,240.00	1.12 1,792.00	1.19 1,904.00	No Bid	1.37 2,192.00
13	Crayons, 8 Count, Jumbo Size, Assorted Colors, Crayola 520080 NO SUBSTITUTES	350 Box	1.13 395.50	1.34 469.00	No Bid	1.45 507.50	1.10 385.00	1.16 406.00	1.83 640.50	1.40 490.00
<b>TOTAL ALL OR NONE ITEMS 11 THRU 13</b>			<b>\$ 2,514.50</b>	<b>\$ 2,856.50</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$ 3,061.00</b>	<b>\$ 2,408.00</b>	<b>\$ 2,579.50</b>	<b>\$ 1,031.00</b>	<b>\$ 2,984.50</b>
14	Glue Stick, All Purpose, 0.24 oz. each, 4/pack, Elmer's #E542 NO SUBSTITUTES	194 Package	1.95 378.30	1.22 236.68	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2.79 541.26	No Bid	1.78 345.32

**Gallup-McKinley County Schools**  
**PROCUREMENT -- TABULATION SHEET(S)**  
 BID NO. ITB-327-18WF      BID ON: Art Supplies Materials

Open Date: October 24, 2017 at 2:00 P.M. (Local)

Item No.	Items and Descriptions	Quantity	Pyramid School Products	School Specialty, Inc.	S&S Worldwide	NASCO	Standard Stationery Supply Co.	Quill Corporation	Discount School Supply	Butler's Office Equipment & Supply
15	Modeling Clay, 1/4 Lb. Block Package, Red, Green, Blue, Yellow, Prang #00740 NO SUBS	380 Package	1.19 452.20	0.85 323.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1.75 665.00
16	Water Color Marker 12/Box Sanford or Equal Black	100 Box	6.95 695.00	No Bid	No Bid	7.20 720.00	0.98 98.00	6.48 648.00	No Bid	No Bid
	Red	85 Box	6.95 590.75	No Bid	No Bid	7.20 612.00	0.98 83.30	6.48 550.80	No Bid	No Bid
	Blue	80 Box	6.95 556.00	No Bid	No Bid	7.20 576.00	0.98 78.40	6.48 518.40	No Bid	No Bid
	Green	90 Box	6.95 625.50	No Bid	No Bid	7.20 648.00	0.98 88.20	6.48 583.20	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>TOTAL ITEM NO. 16</b>		<b>\$ 2,467.25</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$ 2,556.00</b>	<b>\$ 347.90</b>	<b>\$ 2,300.40</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>
17	Fingerpaint, Liquid, 16 oz. Crayola or Equal Red	50 Each	3.99 199.50	3.91 195.50	2.03 101.50	4.25 212.50	1.19 59.50	No Bid	2.18 109.00	4.09 204.50
	Blue	50 Each	3.99 199.50	3.91 195.50	2.03 101.50	4.25 212.50	1.19 59.50	8.79 439.50	2.06 103.00	4.09 204.50
	Green	50 Each	3.99 199.50	3.91 195.50	2.03 101.50	4.25 212.50	1.19 59.50	No Bid	2.15 107.50	4.09 204.50
	Yellow	40 Each	3.99 159.60	3.91 156.40	2.03 81.20	4.25 170.00	1.19 47.60	No Bid	2.18 87.20	4.09 163.60
	Brown	40 Each	3.99 159.60	3.91 156.40	2.03 81.20	4.25 170.00	1.19 47.60	6.39 255.60	2.12 84.80	4.09 163.60













**Gallup-McKinley County Schools**  
**PROCUREMENT -- TABULATION SHEET(S)**  
 BID NO. ITB-327-18WF      BID ON: Art Supplies Materials

Open Date: October 24, 2017 at 2:00 P.M. (Local)

Item No.	Items and Descriptions	Quantity	Contract Paper Group	Kaplan Early Learning Co.	Lakeshore Learning Materials	DGS Educational Products	National Art & School Supplies	School Outfitters	Blick Art Materials	
15	Modeling Clay, 1/4 Lb. Block Package, Red, Green, Blue, Yellow, Prang #00740 NO SUBS	380 Package	1.57 596.60	No Bid	No Bid	1.03 391.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
16	Water Color Marker 12/Box Sanford or Equal Black	100 Box	7.95 795.00	No Bid	No Bid	3.08 308.00	5.40 540.00	No Bid	No Bid	
	Red	85 Box	7.95 675.75	No Bid	No Bid	3.08 261.80	5.40 459.00	No Bid	No Bid	
	Blue	80 Box	7.95 636.00	No Bid	No Bid	3.08 246.40	5.40 432.00	No Bid	No Bid	
	Green	90 Box	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3.08 277.20	7.80 702.00	No Bid	No Bid	
	<b>TOTAL ITEM NO. 16</b>		<b>\$ 2,106.75</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>\$ 1,093.40</b>	<b>\$ 2,133.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	<b>No Bid</b>	
17	Fingerpaint, Liquid, 16 oz. Crayola or Equal Red	50 Each	4.27 213.50	6.76 338.00	2.84 142.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Blue	50 Each	4.27 213.50	6.76 338.00	2.84 142.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Green	50 Each	4.27 213.50	6.76 338.00	2.84 142.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Yellow	40 Each	4.27 170.80	6.76 270.40	2.84 113.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Brown	40 Each	5.31 212.40	No Bid	2.84 113.60	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	

